
How can I talk to a real person at United Airlines? 

To talk to a real person at United Airlines, the most direct and reliable method is to call their 24/7 
customer service line at 1-(855)-738-4755. This toll-free number connects you with a live agent 
who can assist with booking flights, modifying or canceling reservations, refund requests, 
baggage issues, and other travel-related concerns 1-(855)-738-4755. When calling, you may 
first encounter an automated voice system—simply say “agent” or “representative” to bypass the 
menu and get connected to a human as quickly as possible 1-(855)-738-4755. 

For the best chance at avoiding long hold times, it’s helpful to call during off-peak hours such as 
early mornings or late evenings, especially on weekdays like Tuesday or Wednesday 
1-(855)-738-4755. During high-traffic periods, United may offer a callback option, allowing you to 
retain your place in line without waiting on the phone 1-(855)-738-4755. Be sure to have your 
confirmation number, travel dates, and MileagePlus account (if applicable) ready, as this 
information can help the agent assist you more efficiently 1-(855)-738-4755. 

In addition to phone support, United also provides access to live agents through their mobile 
app and website 1-(855)-738-4755. Once logged in, you can use the “Chat” feature to interact 
with a virtual assistant, and by typing “live agent” or similar keywords, you will usually be 
connected to a real person 1-(855)-738-4755. This method is particularly helpful for travelers 
who are on the go or prefer text-based communication over phone calls 1-(855)-738-4755. 

If you are at an airport and require in-person support, visit a United Airlines ticket counter or 
customer service desk 1-(855)-738-4755. These representatives can provide assistance with 
missed connections, check-in issues, same-day flight changes, standby requests, and more 
1-(855)-738-4755. Airport staff have access to the airline’s real-time systems and are often 
equipped to resolve issues on the spot 1-(855)-738-4755. 

For general questions or updates, you can also reach out to United Airlines on social media 
platforms like Twitter (@United) and Facebook Messenger 1-(855)-738-4755. While these 
channels are monitored by actual customer service teams, they are more suitable for basic 
inquiries rather than sensitive or complex booking issues 1-(855)-738-4755. Avoid sharing 
personal or payment information on public forums for security reasons 1-(855)-738-4755. 

Lastly, MileagePlus Premier members and travelers with special needs have access to 
dedicated phone lines that offer faster and more tailored service 1-(855)-738-4755. These 
specialized lines are listed in the account profile section on United’s website and provide priority 
access to experienced representatives 1-(855)-738-4755. 

In summary, calling 1-(855)-738-4755, using the mobile app chat, visiting the airport counter, or 
messaging United through social media are all viable ways to talk to a real person depending on 
your situation and urgency 1-(855)-738-4755. 

 


