
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  

Zeneara is a combination of five 
natural ingredients that promotes 
hearing and ear care. 

 

Zeneara is a combination of plant extracts, nutrients and vitamins that can help support your overall hearing health. 

ZENEARA 

https://eurl.live/zeneara


Zeneara is an hearing aid supplement is available 
exclusively through Zeneara.com. 

Zeneara, priced at $69 per container, claims to promote 
hearing and support ear health. Take two capsules per day 
to allow the natural ingredients to do their work. 

ZENEARA SUPPLEMENT: OFFICIAL WEBSITE 

In our review, we will tell you the truth about Zeneara. 

 
What is Zeneara? 

Zeneara, a nutritional product designed to promote 
healthy ears. 
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Zeneara is a combination of plant extracts, nutrients and 
vitamins that can help support your overall hearing 
health. The supplement contains probiotics and vitamin 
B6. 

Zeneara is marketed to people who suffer from hearing 
loss, tinnitus and other ear issues. Zeneara is a great 
supplement to help with hearing loss, ringing or tinnitus, 
and to maintain your hearing as you get older. 

Zeneara costs $69 per bottle. It is exclusively available on 
Zeneara.com. All purchases are covered by a 180-day 
money back guarantee. 

Zeneara Benefits 

Zeneara is targeted primarily at people who suffer from 
hearing loss or tinnitus. The manufacturer claims that the 
supplement supports benefits such as: 

 Promoting overall hearing health 
 Tinnitus can be reduced in severity 
 Blend of five natural ingredients backed by science 

Support for ear health 
 Made in the United States at a GMP-certified, FDA-

registered facility 
 Money back guarantee of 180 days 
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What is Zeneara? 

Zeneara is a combination of five natural ingredients that 
promotes hearing and ear care. 

Zeneara capsules contain two nutrients (zinc, vitamin B6, 
and two probiotics), as well as one plant extract, 
California poppy. 

The ingredients in these products work differently and on 
different pathways. They can help improve hearing and 
relieve tinnitus, among other benefits. 

Zeneara contains ingredients that target blood flow in the 
ears. The more oxygen and nutrients that reach the 
targeted area of your ear, the better it will be for hearing 
and ear care. 

Some ingredients are unique in their actions. Zeneara, for 
instance, contains probiotics that promote gut health. 
Zeneara's makers claim that "your gut could play a part in 
neurotransmitter creation." The probiotics found in 
Zeneara balance your gut microbiota and allow your body 
to make the neurotransmitters necessary for hearing and 
ear care. According to research, your body has a “gut-
brain" axis that influences neurotransmitter creation. This 
means that problems in your stomach could impact your 
cognition and hearing. 
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Zinc and vitamin b6 have also been directly linked to 
hearing loss. Deficient people in zinc and vitamin B6 
have poorer hearing and ear health. 

Take Zeneara 

 Zeneara is recommended to be taken twice daily. 
 Zeneara capsules can be taken in the morning. 
 Take one capsule of Zeneara at night. 
 You can improve your hearing and ear health by 

taking two Zeneara capsules daily. This will take 
weeks, if not days. 

Zeneara Ingredients 

Zeneara is a combination of herbs, plant extracts and 
vitamins, minerals and nutrients. 

Zeneara's manufacturer claims that it has researched over 
350 potential ingredients. These ingredients support 
hearing and ear care in various ways. 
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All-natural formula includes the following ingredients 

 
The most important ingredient in Zeneara is zinc. Zinc, 
according to Zeneara's makers, "has been proven...to 
reduce the subjective severity [of tinnitus] by as much as 
82%." Zeneara contains enough zinc to combat tinnitus, 
and reduce the ringing of your ears. Researchers think 
zinc could help with tinnitus, as it can affect the synapses 
in the auditory system. It also plays a part in the cochlear 
physiological process. 

Vitamin B6: The B6 vitamin is essential for cellular 
energy. It helps you feel more mentally and physically 
energized by promoting the conversion of food to energy 
at the cell level. Zeneara's manufacturer explains that 
vitamin B6 also plays a role in the proper functioning of 
the nervous system. If your nervous system is not 
working properly, it could send unclear signals to the rest 
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of the body. Zeneara's vitamin B6 could help maintain a 
healthy nervous and hearing system. 

California Poppy California Poppy will "support a 
healthy inflammation response" according to Zeneara's 
manufacturer. Hearing becomes harder when 
inflammation levels are high. Inflammation in the ears 
and around them can make it difficult to hear or interpret 
sound. California poppy contains natural antioxidants that 
support healthy inflammation in the body. This makes it 
easier to listen. 

Probiotics Zeneara is a blend that contains probiotics or 
good gut bacteria. Probiotics are beneficial bacteria that 
work in your digestive system to help break down food 
and support immunity. They also extract nutrients from 
food. Probiotics are unusual in hearing aid formulas. 
Zeneara's makers claim that "your gut could play a part in 
neurotransmitter generation." This is because of the gut 
brain axis and the distinct connection between your gut 
bacteria and your mind. Your hearing could be affected if 
your gut-brain system is not working properly, for 
example because your gut bacteria are imbalanced. A 
dysbiosis in the gut can also affect other aspects of 
hearing health and wellness. Zeneara contains a variety of 
probiotic strains. 
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Zeneara's five ingredients, which were carefully selected, 
are said to have a synergistic effect, promoting healthy 
nerve function, enhancing sleep and maintaining 
cognitive health. The five ingredients work together to 
create a synergistic effect, enhancing the benefits of the 
formula. 

Zeneara: Scientific Evidence 

Can zinc, probiotics and plant extracts stop tinnitus 
really? Does Zeneara's effect on hearing loss have any 
scientific basis? Does the formula promote ear health 
really? Below, we'll examine the science behind Zeneara. 

California poppy, is one of Zeneara's more unique 
ingredients. Zeneara's makers added the plant extract 
because it promotes healthy inflammation in the body. 
This can help with hearing health and ear care. California 
poppy has not been studied specifically in relation to 
hearing. One study revealed that California poppy 
contains alkaloids, and other natural compounds which 
could act as GABA-receptors and reduce inflammation. 
Researchers believe that California poppy may have 
analgesic, anxiolytic, and sedative effects. 

Vitamin A has been specifically linked to hearing loss. 
You could be at a greater risk of hearing loss if you don't 
get enough vitamin B6. In a 2011 study for instance, 
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vitamin B6 deficiencies were associated with an increased 
risk of hearing loss among men. Researchers found that 
taking supplements of vitamin B6, C E, B12 and folate 
could help reduce your risk of hearing loss, especially if 
any of these nutrients are deficient. 

Zinc was studied for its effect on tinnitus. Some people 
have been able to relieve their tinnitus by using zinc. 
Researchers gave zinc supplements to 20 adults with 
tinnitus in a 2019 research. After two months, researchers 
found that 85% of participants who took zinc saw a 
significant improvement on the Tinnitus Handicap 
Inventory. Zeneara, a hearing aid that is sold to those who 
suffer from tinnitus and hearing loss, contains zinc. 

Studies have shown that probiotics can help to reduce 
hearing loss. Researchers have linked everything from ear 
infection to tinnitus and hearing loss to an imbalanced gut 
microbiota. Probiotic supplements can help balance out 
the bacteria in your gut if they are unbalanced. 
Researchers found specific proof that probiotic imbalance 
is linked to ear problems in children. 

Zeneara does not appear to reverse or improve hearing 
loss. Some of the ingredients, like zinc, have been shown 
in studies to relieve symptoms of tinnitus. Zeneara can 
help you with tinnitus and maintain your hearing health. 
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Zeneara Pricing 

Zeneara can only be purchased through Zeneara.com. 
Zeneara is not sold by online or off-line retailers. 

Zeneara is available online at the following prices: 

 1 Bottle: $69. + $9.99 Shipping 
 3 bottles: $177 (59 cents per bottle) + free shipping + 

2 bonus guides 
 6 bottles: $294 (49 cents per bottle) + free shipping + 

2 bonus guides 

Zeneara comes in bottles of 60 capsules, which is a 30-
day supply. Take two capsules per day to improve your 
hearing and ear. 

Zeneara Bonuses Included 

Zeneara's makers are offering two bonus guides free with 
every purchase of 3 or 6 bottles of the supplement as part 
of their 2024 promotion. You can get two PDF guides for 
free if you purchase 3 or 6 Zeneara bottles online. 

Two bonus guides are included: 

Free bonus guide #1: 5 Foods that can damage ear health: 
It's possible you eat foods that silently harm your ears 
every day. This guide will help you identify these foods 
and learn what to eat in place of them for healthy hearing. 

https://eurl.live/zeneara
https://eurl.live/zeneara


Natural ingredients in some foods can worsen hearing 
health and damage the ear. This illustrated guide 
describes how certain foods can create a toxic 
environment in your ears. It also explains natural ways to 
reverse the damage. This guide costs $20. 

Bonus Guide #2: Stop Stress: Secrets to a Stress-Free 
Life: Stress kills silently. It can worsen heart health and 
hormonal balance. It speeds up aging. This guide is 
normally $20 and the author dives deep into the effects 
stress has on the body, including its emotional and 
physiological impact. Discover natural ways to reduce 
stress and live a healthier, happier life. 

Zeneara Refund Policy 

Zeneara offers a 180-day satisfaction guarantee on all 
purchases. Zeneara is available for 180 days or six 
months to test it out and decide if it's right for you. If not, 
you can request a full refund. Zeneara is a 100% refund if 
it doesn't suit you or you are unhappy. 

Zeneara 

Zeneara is manufactured in the United States, in a GMP-
certified FDA registered facility. The manufacturer 
claims that they have used only the best ingredients in the 
formulation, including GMO-free gluten-free and 
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pesticide-free ingredients sourced from both domestic and 
foreign suppliers. 

Zeneara is based in Tallmadge in Ohio, but also maintains 
a production facility in Englewood in Colorado. 

Zeneara can be contacted via the following contact 
details: 

 Email: support@zeneara.com 
 Mailing address: 285, Northeast Ave., Tallmadge OH, 

USA 

Final Word 

Zeneara, a hearing aid and ear health product is sold by 
Zeneara.com. 

Zeneara, priced at $69 per container, contains a 
combination of five ingredients selected by hand that 
support hearing in various ways. Zinc, probiotics and 
California poppy are some of the ingredients in this 
formula that work with different pathways to improve 
hearing. 
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